
Peraković, D., Kavran, Z., Remenar V.
University of Zagreb

Faculty of Traffic and Transport Sciences, Zagreb, Vukelićeva 4
{dragan.perakovic, zvonko.kavran, vladimir.remenar}@fpz.hr

Drawbacks of Implementing e-Learning System 
i n  t h e  T e a c h i n g  P r o c e s s  a t  t h e  
Faculty of Transport and Traffic Sciences

ABSTRACT
The introduction and usage of the e-Lear-
ning system for distance learning, i.e. lear-
ning via the Internet or some other advan-
ced multimedia method, has become an 
obligation and not just a possibility, in all 
the educational institutions, in the function 
of proactive continuous modernization of 
the teaching process by applying ICT. Altho-
ugh e-Learning is mostly mentioned within 
the context of learning at the educational 
institutions, companies are increasingly 
accepting and introducing distance learning 
systems.
Negative effects of the implementation 
have not been sufficiently studied. It is easy 
to notice that the past focus of research re-
ferred mainly to positive effects on imple-
menting the e-Learning method.
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The relatively short period, and the limited 
number of syllabuses which apply their own 
developed e-Learning systems at the Faculty 
of Transport and Traffic Sciences (Faculty), 
have yielded the realized results of evalua-
ting the implementation. The number of re-
presented subjects in the e-Learning system 
is continuously growing, and consequently 
also the number of included students and 
the teaching staff.
In the carried out surveys among students at 
the Faculty the majority of students has 
assessed this method of learning as very 
useful and a significant advancement in re-
lation to classical learning methods. The 
assessment of their level of knowledge 
before using the system and afterwards, has 
shown significant increase and the students 
expressed a great wish for further develo-
pment of the system and implementation of 
the system into the work of the entire Facul-
ty. A very high percentage of students expre-
ssed a desire to introduce this type of 
studying i.e. learning in all the syllabuses, at 
all three courses of study at the Faculty. Re-
search and surveys of other faculties and 
companies involved in the development of 
e-Learning systems are analogue to the achi-
eved results at the Faculty. 

Figure 1. Survey: 
Is it necessary to implement e-Learning system
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E-Learning methodology brings significant, 
already known positive effects which are 
almost impossible to achieve through tradi-
tional learning methods. The usage of e-
Learning allows the attendants, i.e. stu-
dents to learn the subject matter in their 
comfortable environment and according to 
the dynamics which they can determine by 
themselves. The materials necessary to ac-
quire the required knowledge are always 
available to the students, and the students 
can determine by themselves which mate-
rial they want to study and when. Multime-
dia helps students in acquiring the knowl-
edge in an easier way and the implementa-
tion itself of advanced technology and mul-
timedia contents make it more interesting 
to the students.

Figure 2. 
Number of published materials

77%

16%

7%

Yes

No

I don't know

0

200

400

600

800

1000

1200

1400

1600

2005. 2006. 2007. 2008.

DRAWBACKS

DRAWBACKS
With all the advantages offered by e-Learn-
ing and the surveys and research that to a 
high percentage present e-Learning as a 
very positive learning method, and a learn-
ing method of the future, very often the 
drawbacks are neglected and they need to 
be studied into detail and a solution should 
be found.
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Figure 3. 
Grades od students papers

The research results presented in this paper 
focus also on a number of drawbacks. As the 
basic drawback in implementing the e-
Learning system at the Faculty has been the 
need for information technology equipment 
of each individual student. 

During the three-year implementation it has 
been noticed that the way of thinking and 
the behavior of a certain number of stu-
dents have remained unchanged, and that 
the implementation of e-Learning system 
has brought about an entire series of at-
tempts at fraud in performing the students’ 
tasks. The approach to solving of this prob-
lem is very complex and proactive, and 
ranges from student’s authorization, moni-
toring of students in studying, all the way to 
defining the time periods reserved for solv-
ing the tasks and random selection of the 
questions during knowledge testing.
Large volume of available materials and the 
possibility of easy searching, both on the In-
ternet and through the published materials 
by means of e-Learning system, offers the 
students the possibility of plagiarism in pro-
ducing seminar papers, when they try to 
submit the already published papers writ-
ten by others as their own. 

Figure 4.
Prevented plagiarism
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